Fw: Grayeyes SJDems contributions to your campaign YTD

From: Willie Grayeyes (williegrayeyes@yahoo.com)

To: victuba@yahoo.com

Date: Saturday, October 29, 2022 at 07:39 PM MST

Print this please. Thx.

----- Forwarded Message

From: Willie Grayeyes <williegrayeyes@yahoo.com>

To: Janet Ross <janetross7777@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, October 27, 2022 at 09:36:04 AM PDT
Subject: Re: Grayeyes SJDems contributions to your campaign YTD

Thank you, Janet.

On Thursday, October 27, 2022 at 08:41:11 AM PDT, Janet Ross <janetross7777@gmail.com> wrote:

2022
8/23/2022
9/2/2022
9/2/2022
9/19/2022
9/26/2022
10/24/2022

Canva

Signs on the Cheap

Vista Print
Vistago Print

Banners.com
Native Broadcasting/KTNN

All are in kind donations

$105.00 paid
$ 625.36 paid
$ 207.92 paid
$ 405.53 paid
$ 322.82 paid
$ 800.00 paid

Grayeyes literature
Willie Grayeyes signs
stakes for all

heavy duty sign stakes
banners Willie

Willie Grayeyes radio ad

The two stakes expenses divide by 4 for your share so 51.98 and 101.38 respectively for you

anything the Party paid for directly should be reported as in-kind. If the Party (or anyone else)
wrote a check directly to the candidate, that is a normal donation.

Janet



